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Corrigendum No. 1 to the Tender Document 

 
 

 
 
 



 

 CORRIGENDUM TO THE TENDER DOCUMENT  
 
 
The following Corrigendum to the Tender Document is hereby issued:- 
 

S.N Title of the clause         Existing  To be read as 

1 Page No. 15 – 
Clause No.4 – 
Eligibility 
Criteria- 4.1 – 
Eligibility for 
Integrated Library 
Management 
Software-  S.No.6 

Eligibility Conditions:  
The OEM of Integrated 
Library Management 
Software should have atleast 
two service centre across 
Tamil Nadu. 
 
 
 
Documentary Proof to be 
submitted:  
In case of Bidder’s Own 
Service Centre, the copies 
of the land-line telephone 
bills (month before the due 
date) / valid rental 
agreement/any legal proof 
shall be submitted as a 
proof for availability of the 
service centres. 
In case of Bidder’s 
Franchisee Service centre, 
copy of the valid agreement 
entered between the 
Franchisee and the OEM / 
Bidder shall be submitted. 

Eligibility Conditions:  
Original Source Code 
Developer (OSCD) of 
Integrated Library 
Management Software 
should have atleast two 
support centres across 
Tamil Nadu. 
 
Documentary Proof to be 
submitted: 
Copies of the land-line 
telephone bills for the 
month before the due date 
/valid rental agreement/ 
any valid legal proof 
should be submitted as a 
proof of availability of two 
support centres across 
Tamil Nadu. 

2 Page No. 16 – 
Clause No.4 – 
Eligibility 
Criteria- 4.2 – 
Eligibility for 
Barcode Printer/ 
Scanner Bidder-  
S.No.6 

Bidder shall have executed 
Single order for supply, 
installation and 
commissioning of  barcode 
printer /  barcode scanner/ 
any Printer for   a value of 
at least Rs. 0.50 Lakh or 
above for any Government  
Libraries / any college 
libraries in Tamil Nadu  in 
the last 3 years. 

Bidder shall have executed 
Single order for supply, 
installation and 
commissioning of  barcode 
printer /  barcode scanner/ 
any Printer for   a value of 
at least Rs. 0.50 Lakh or 
above for any Government 
department / any PSUs  in 
Tamil Nadu  in the last 3 
years. 



3 Page No. 71-  
A1.7- Hardware 
Compliance 

Item Code:  
 
33287- LS-005- Barcode 
Scanner – Table Top 
 
33287- LS-006 - Barcode 
Scanner - Hand Held with 
stand 
 
33287- LS-007- Barcode 
Printers 
 
33287- LS-008 - Barcode 
Sticker 
 
33287- LS-009 - Barcode 
Ribbon 

Item Code:  
 
33287- LS-004- Barcode 
Scanner – Table Top 
 
33287- LS-005 - Barcode 
Scanner - Hand Held with 
stand 
 
33287- LS-006- Barcode 
Printers 
 
33287- LS-007 - Barcode 
Sticker 
 
33287- LS-008 - Barcode 

Ribbon 

 
 
 Note:   The above corrigendum is applicable to all other clauses, which contain   
              the respective terms in the tender document. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

Managing Director 
                                                                                                                (SD/-) 


